AUTHENTICATED
U.S. GOVERNMENT
INFORMATION

GPO

11

1191H CONGRESS
L2 S, 3696

To amend section 5 of the Reforming Intellicence and Securing America
Act to ensure Member access to the Foreign Intelligence Surveillance
Court and Foreign Intelligence Surveillance Court of Review, and for
other purposes.

IN THE SENATE OF THE UNITED STATES

JANUARY 27, 2026
Mr. GRASSLEY introduced the following bill; which was read twice and referred
te] ’
to the Committee on the Judiciary

A BILL

To amend section 5 of the Reforming Intelligence and Secur-
ing America Act to ensure Member access to the Foreign
Intelligence Surveillance Court and Foreign Intellicence
Surveillance Court of Review, and for other purposes.

1 Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representa-
tives of the United States of America in Congress assembled,

SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE.

This Act may be cited as the “FISA Accountability

[V B SN VS B O]

and Extension Act of 20267,



2
1 SEC. 2. ENSURING MEMBER ACCESS TO THE FOREIGN IN-

TELLIGENCE SURVEILLANCE COURT AND
FOREIGN INTELLIGENCE SURVEILLANCE

COURT OF REVIEW.

2
3
4
5 Section 5 of the Reforming Intelligence and Securing
6 America Act (50 U.S.C. 1803 note), is amended—

7 (1) in subsection (d) by striking “on their be-
8 half, pursuant to such procedures as the Attorney
9 seneral, in consultation with the Director of Na-
10 tional Intelligence may establish” and inserting “‘in
11 addition or on their behalf”’; and

12 (2) by adding at the end the following:

13 “(e) REVOKING PREVIOUS PROCEDURES.

Any pro-
14 cedures promuleated by the Attorney General in consulta-
15 tion with the Director of National Intelligence pursuant
16 to subsection (d) as in effect before the date of enactment
17 of this subsection shall be void, including the Attorney
18 General Procedures for Congressional Attendance at Pro-
19 ceedings of the Foreign Intellicence Surveillance Court
20 and the Foreign Intelligence Surveillance Court of Review

21 dated November 18, 2024.

22 “(f) PROHIBITION ON RESTRICTIONS.

23 “(1) IN GENERAL.—The Foreign Intelligence
24 Surveillance Court and the Foreign Intelligence Sur-
25 veillance Court of Review shall not have any author-
26 ity to 1mpose any restrictions on Members or des-

*S 3696 IS



O o0 N N W Bk W =

[\© TN NG I N T NG I NG R NS B N e T e e T e T e e T
[ B NG U N N = = N Re - BN B o) W ) TR ~S O I NO S e

3

ignated staff attending proceedings pursuant to sub-
section (d) that are not also applied to the Depart-
ment of Justice.

“(2) REQUIREMENTS.—Each individual and
designated staff described in subsection (d) shall be
allowed to observe in its entirety any proceeding of
the Foreign Intelligence Surveillance Court or the
Foreign Intelligence Surveillance Court of Review.

“(3) SPACE CONSTRAINTS.—

“(A) IN GENERAL.—The Foreign Intel-
ligence Surveillance Court and the Foreign In-
telligence Surveillance Court of Review shall use
all physical space to the maximum extent pos-
sible, such that any individual and designated
staff described in subsection (d) present in at-
tendance shall have physical access to the
courtrooms of the Foreign Intelligence Surveil-
lance Court and Foreign Intelligence Surveil-
lance Court of Review to attend any proceeding
of such courts.

“(B) ALTERNATIVE IF SPACE UNAVAIL-
ABLE.—If the Foreign Intelligence Surveillance
Court or the Foreign Intelligence Surveillance
Court of Review is unable to accommodate all

individuals and staff deseribed in subsection (d)

*S 3696 IS



O o0 N N Bk W =

|\ T N© TR NG T NS R NS R L e e T e T e e e T
A W N = O VWV 0 N O B BN~ WD = ©

4

due to courtroom physical space constraints,
such courts shall provide any such present indi-
viduals and staff who are not able to be phys-
ically present in the courtroom during a pro-
ceeding with full visual and audio access to ob-
serve the proceeding.”.

SEC. 3. PENALTIES.

(a) OFFENSES.

Section 109(a) of the Foreign Intel-
licence Surveillance Act of 1978 (50 U.S.C. 1809) is
amended by adding at the end the following:

“(e) INFORMATION ACQUIRED UNDER SECTION
702.—Information acquired under section 702 of this Act
shall be deemed to be information acquired from an elec-
tronic surveillance pursuant to title I for purposes of this
section.”.

(b) CrviL AcTIiONS.—Section 110 of the Foreign In-

telligence Surveillance Act of 1978 (50 U.S.C. 1810) is
amended—

(1) by redesignating paragraphs (1) and (2) of
subsection (a) as subparagraphs (A) and (B), re-
spectively, and adjusting the margins accordingly;

(2) by redesignating subsections (a), (b), and
(¢) as paragraphs (1), (2), and (3), respectively, and

adjusting the margins accordingly;

*S 3696 IS



O o0 N N B W =

O TN NG N N TR NG N NG I NS R N e T e e T e T e e T
[ B NG U N N = = N Re - BN B o) W ) TR ~S O I NO S e

5}

(3) in the matter preceding paragraph (1), as
so redesignated—

(A) by striking “An agerieved” and insert-
ing the following:

“(a) IN GENERAL.—An aggrieved’’;

(4) in subsection (a), as so redesignated, in the
matter preceding paragraph (1), as so redesig-
nated—

(A) by inserting “or in violation of section

1623 of title 18, United States Code,” after “in

violation of section 109”; and

(B) by inserting “, or who knowingly aided
or abetted any person in committing such viola-
tion,”” after “‘such violation”; and

(5) by adding at the end the following:

“(b) EXCEPTION.—No cause of action shall lie in any
court against a provider of a wire or electronic commu-
nication service, landlord, custodian, or other person (in-
cluding any officer, employee, agent, or other specified
person thereof) that furnishes any information, facilities,
or technical assistance in accordance with a court order
or request for emergency assistance under this Act.

“(¢) INFORMATION ACQUIRED UNDER SECTION
702.—Information acquired under section 702 of this Act

shall be deemed to be information acquired from an elec-

*S 3696 IS



O o0 N N W BB W =

O TN NG N N T NG I NS R NS B N e T e e T e T e T T
[ T NG U N N = = N Re - BN B o) W ) B ~S O I NO S e

6
tronic surveillance pursuant to title I for purposes of this
section.

“(d) STATUTE OF LIMITATIONS.—An action under
this section may not be commenced later than 5 years
after the date the agerieved party first obtained actual no-
tice of the violation.”.

(¢) CrviL LIABILITY FOR PHYSICAL SEARCHES.—
Section 308 of the Foreign Intelligence Surveillance Act
(50 U.S.C. 1828) is amended, in the matter preceding

“, or who knowingly aided or

paragraph (1), by inserting
abetted any person in committing such violation,” after
“such violation”.
SEC. 4. AMICUS CURIAE DESIGNATION.
Section 103(1)(1) of the Foreign Intelligence Surveil-
lance Act of 1978 (50 U.S.C. 1803(1)(1)) is amended—
(1) by striking “The presiding judges” and in-
serting the following:
“(B) DESIGNATION  BY  PRESIDING
JUDGES.—;
(2) by inserting before subparagraph (B), as so
designated, the following:
“(A) PROPOSAL FOR DESIGNATION.—

“(1) SENATE PROPOSALS.—Not later

than 90 days after the date of enactment

of the FISA Accountability and Extension

*S 3696 IS



O o0 N N W BB W

O TN NG I N T NG I NG I N0 B N e T e e T e T e e T
[ N N U N N = = NN - BN B o) W ) B ~S O I NO R e

*S 3696 IS

7

Act of 2026, the majority leader of the
Senate, with the consent of the minority
leader of the Senate and in consultation
with the chair and vice chair of the Select
Committee on Intelligence of the Senate
and the chair and ranking member of the
Committee on the Judiciary of the Senate,
shall submit a list of not fewer than 6 indi-
viduals to the presiding judges of the
courts established under subsections (a)
and (b) to be considered for designation as
amicus curiae under subparagraph (B) of
this paragraph.

“(1) HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES

PROPOSALS.—Not later than 90 days after
the date of enactment of the FISA Ac-
countability and Extension Act of 2026,
the Speaker of the House of Representa-
tives, with the consent of the minority
leader of the House of Representatives and
in consultation with the chair and ranking
member of the Permanent Select Com-
mittee on Intelligence of the House of Rep-
resentatives and the chair and ranking

member of the Committee on the Judiciary



O o0 N N B W =

| \O JEE \© R NS R O N O R e e e e e T e e e e
A LW O = O VOV 0 N O R WD = O

8

of the Iouse of Representatives, shall sub-
mit a list of not fewer than 6 individuals
to the presiding judges of the courts estab-
lished under subsections (a) and (b) to be
considered for designation as amicus curiae
under subparagraph (B) of this paragraph.

“(111) MODIFICATION OF LISTS.—The
majority leader of the Senate or the Speak-
er of the House of Representatives, with
respect to a list submitted under clause (1)
or (i1), respectively—

“(I) may modify the list at any
time in accordance with the require-
ments of the respective clause; and

“(II) shall ensure that the list in-
cludes not fewer than 6 individuals at

all times.”’;

(3) in subparagraph (B), as so designated—

(A) in the first sentence, by striking “after

the enactment of this subsection, jointly des-

ignate not fewer than 5 individuals” and insert-

ing “‘after the date of enactment of the FISA

Accountability and Extension Act of 2026,

jointly designate not fewer than 8 individuals

*S 3696 IS



O o0 N N W B W =

[ w—
e

12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

9

from the lists submitted under subparagraph
(A) of this paragraph’; and

(B) by striking the second sentence; and
(4) by adding at the end the following:

“(C) TRANSITION.—On the date of sub-
mission of the list under clause (1) or (i1) of
subparagraph (A), whichever submission occurs
first, any individual serving as amicus curiae
shall be removed and all designations shall
occur pursuant to subparagraphs (A) and
(B).”.

SEC. 5. WHISTLEBLOWER DISCLOSURES.

Section 416 of title 5, United States Code, is amend-

ed in subsection (e) by adding at the end the following:
“(4) RULE OF CONSTRUCTION.—Nothing in

this subsection may be construed to revoke or dimin-

ish any right of an individual provided by section

2303 or 7211 of this title to make a protected dis-

closure to any congressional committee.”.
SEC. 6. EXTENSION OF AUTHORITIES.

(a) FISA AMENDMENTS AcCT OF 2008.—Section
403(b) of the FISA Amendments Act of 2008 (Public Law
110-261; 122 Stat. 2474) is amended—

(1) in paragraph (1), by striking “two years”

and inserting “8 years”; and

*S 3696 IS



10
| (2) in paragraph (2) in the matter preceding
subparagraph (A), by striking “two years” and in-

serting ‘8 years’.

of the FISA Amendments Act of 2008 (Public Law 110-

2
3
4 (b) CONFORMING AMENDMENT.—Section 404(b)(1)
5
6 261; 122 Stat. 2476), is amended in the subsection head-
7

ing by striking “Two YEARS” and inserting “8 YEARS”.

O

*S 3696 IS




<<
  /ASCII85EncodePages false
  /AllowTransparency false
  /AutoPositionEPSFiles true
  /AutoRotatePages /None
  /Binding /Left
  /CalGrayProfile (Dot Gain 20%)
  /CalRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CalCMYKProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /sRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CannotEmbedFontPolicy /Error
  /CompatibilityLevel 1.4
  /CompressObjects /Off
  /CompressPages true
  /ConvertImagesToIndexed true
  /PassThroughJPEGImages true
  /CreateJobTicket false
  /DefaultRenderingIntent /Default
  /DetectBlends true
  /DetectCurves 0.0000
  /ColorConversionStrategy /LeaveColorUnchanged
  /DoThumbnails false
  /EmbedAllFonts true
  /EmbedOpenType false
  /ParseICCProfilesInComments true
  /EmbedJobOptions true
  /DSCReportingLevel 0
  /EmitDSCWarnings false
  /EndPage -1
  /ImageMemory 1048576
  /LockDistillerParams true
  /MaxSubsetPct 100
  /Optimize false
  /OPM 1
  /ParseDSCComments true
  /ParseDSCCommentsForDocInfo true
  /PreserveCopyPage true
  /PreserveDICMYKValues true
  /PreserveEPSInfo true
  /PreserveFlatness true
  /PreserveHalftoneInfo false
  /PreserveOPIComments true
  /PreserveOverprintSettings true
  /StartPage 1
  /SubsetFonts false
  /TransferFunctionInfo /Preserve
  /UCRandBGInfo /Preserve
  /UsePrologue true
  /ColorSettingsFile ()
  /AlwaysEmbed [ true
  ]
  /NeverEmbed [ true
  ]
  /AntiAliasColorImages false
  /CropColorImages true
  /ColorImageMinResolution 300
  /ColorImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleColorImages false
  /ColorImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /ColorImageResolution 300
  /ColorImageDepth 8
  /ColorImageMinDownsampleDepth 1
  /ColorImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeColorImages true
  /ColorImageFilter /FlateEncode
  /AutoFilterColorImages false
  /ColorImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /ColorACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /ColorImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasGrayImages false
  /CropGrayImages true
  /GrayImageMinResolution 300
  /GrayImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleGrayImages false
  /GrayImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /GrayImageResolution 300
  /GrayImageDepth 8
  /GrayImageMinDownsampleDepth 2
  /GrayImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeGrayImages true
  /GrayImageFilter /FlateEncode
  /AutoFilterGrayImages false
  /GrayImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /GrayACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /GrayImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasMonoImages false
  /CropMonoImages true
  /MonoImageMinResolution 1200
  /MonoImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleMonoImages false
  /MonoImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /MonoImageResolution 1200
  /MonoImageDepth -1
  /MonoImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeMonoImages true
  /MonoImageFilter /CCITTFaxEncode
  /MonoImageDict <<
    /K -1
  >>
  /AllowPSXObjects false
  /CheckCompliance [
    /None
  ]
  /PDFX1aCheck true
  /PDFX3Check false
  /PDFXCompliantPDFOnly true
  /PDFXNoTrimBoxError false
  /PDFXTrimBoxToMediaBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXSetBleedBoxToMediaBox true
  /PDFXBleedBoxToTrimBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXOutputIntentProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /PDFXOutputConditionIdentifier (CGATS TR 001)
  /PDFXOutputCondition ()
  /PDFXRegistryName (http://www.color.org)
  /PDFXTrapped /False

  /CreateJDFFile false
  /Description <<

    /BGR <>
    /CHS <>
    /CHT <>
    /CZE <>
    /DAN <>
    /DEU <>
    /ESP <>
    /ETI <>
    /FRA <>
    /GRE <>

    /HRV <>
    /HUN <>
    /ITA (Utilizzare queste impostazioni per creare documenti Adobe PDF che devono essere conformi o verificati in base a PDF/X-1a:2001, uno standard ISO per lo scambio di contenuto grafico. Per ulteriori informazioni sulla creazione di documenti PDF compatibili con PDF/X-1a, consultare la Guida dell'utente di Acrobat. I documenti PDF creati possono essere aperti con Acrobat e Adobe Reader 4.0 e versioni successive.)
    /JPN <>
    /KOR <>
    /LTH <>
    /LVI <>
    /NLD (Gebruik deze instellingen om Adobe PDF-documenten te maken die moeten worden gecontroleerd of moeten voldoen aan PDF/X-1a:2001, een ISO-standaard voor het uitwisselen van grafische gegevens. Raadpleeg de gebruikershandleiding van Acrobat voor meer informatie over het maken van PDF-documenten die compatibel zijn met PDF/X-1a. De gemaakte PDF-documenten kunnen worden geopend met Acrobat en Adobe Reader 4.0 en hoger.)
    /NOR <>
    /POL <>
    /PTB <>
    /RUM <>
    /RUS <>
    /SKY <>
    /SLV <>
    /SUO <>
    /SVE <>
    /TUR <>
    /UKR <>
    /ENU (Use these settings to create Adobe PDF documents that are to be checked or must conform to PDF/X-1a:2001, an ISO standard for graphic content exchange.  For more information on creating PDF/X-1a compliant PDF documents, please refer to the Acrobat User Guide.  Created PDF documents can be opened with Acrobat and Adobe Reader 4.0 and later.)
  >>
  /Namespace [
    (Adobe)
    (Common)
    (1.0)
  ]
  /OtherNamespaces [
    <<
      /AsReaderSpreads false
      /CropImagesToFrames true
      /ErrorControl /WarnAndContinue
      /FlattenerIgnoreSpreadOverrides false
      /IncludeGuidesGrids false
      /IncludeNonPrinting false
      /IncludeSlug false
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (InDesign)
        (4.0)
      ]
      /OmitPlacedBitmaps false
      /OmitPlacedEPS false
      /OmitPlacedPDF false
      /SimulateOverprint /Legacy
    >>
    <<
      /AddBleedMarks false
      /AddColorBars false
      /AddCropMarks false
      /AddPageInfo false
      /AddRegMarks false
      /ConvertColors /ConvertToCMYK
      /DestinationProfileName ()
      /DestinationProfileSelector /DocumentCMYK
      /Downsample16BitImages true
      /FlattenerPreset <<
        /PresetSelector /HighResolution
      >>
      /FormElements false
      /GenerateStructure false
      /IncludeBookmarks false
      /IncludeHyperlinks false
      /IncludeInteractive false
      /IncludeLayers false
      /IncludeProfiles false
      /MultimediaHandling /UseObjectSettings
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (CreativeSuite)
        (2.0)
      ]
      /PDFXOutputIntentProfileSelector /DocumentCMYK
      /PreserveEditing true
      /UntaggedCMYKHandling /LeaveUntagged
      /UntaggedRGBHandling /UseDocumentProfile
      /UseDocumentBleed false
    >>
  ]
>> setdistillerparams
<<
  /HWResolution [2400 2400]
  /PageSize [612.000 792.000]
>> setpagedevice


		Superintendent of Documents
	2026-07-11T18:02:18-0400
	Government Publishing Office, Washington, DC 20401
	U.S. Government Publishing Office
	Government Publishing Office attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by Government Publishing Office




