AUTHENTICATED
U.S. GOVERNMENT
INFORMATION

GPO

11

1191H CONGRESS
18T SESSION S o 2 8 5 3

To amend title 38, United States Code, to extend certain authorities and
requirements relating to health care and benefits furnished by the De-
partment of Veterans Affairs, and for other purposes.

IN THE SENATE OF THE UNITED STATES

SEPTEMBER 17 (legislative day, SEPTEMBER 16), 2025
Mr. MORAN (for himself and Mr. BLUMENTHAL) introduced the following bill;
which was read twice and referred to the Committee on Veterans’ Affairs

A BILL

To amend title 38, United States Code, to extend certain
authorities and requirements relating to health care and
benefits furnished by the Department of Veterans Af-

fairs, and for other purposes.

1 Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representa-
tives of the United States of America in Congress assembled,
SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE; TABLE OF CONTENTS.

(a) SHORT TITLE.—This Act may be cited as the

“VA Extenders Act of 20257,

(b) TABLE OF CONTENTS.—The table of contents for

~N N O B W

this Act is as follows:
Sec. 1. Short title; table of contents.

TITLE I—HEALTH CARE MATTERS



See. 103.

See. 104.

See. 201.

See. 203.

See. 204.

2

Extension of authority for collection of copayments for hospital care
and nursing home care.

Extension of requirement to provide nursing home care to certain vet-
erans with service-connected disabilities.

Extension of Staff Sergeant Parker Gordon Fox Suicide Prevention
Grant Program.

Extension of funding for expansion of Rural Access Network for
Growth Enhancement Program.

TITLE II—BENEFITS

Extension of requirement for quarterly briefings on administration of
authorities relating to determinations regarding presumptions
of service connection based on toxic exposure.

Extension of requirement relating to restoration of entitlement to
educational assistance in cases of closure or disapproval of edu-
cational institutions.

Extension of temporary clarification of licensure requirements for
contractor medical professionals to perform medical disability
examinations for the Department of Veterans Affairs under
pilot program for use of contract physicians for disability ex-
aminations.

Extension of authority to maintain regional office in Republic of Phil-
ippines.

TITLE HI—HOUSING

Extension of authorization of appropriations for homeless women vet-
erans and homeless veterans with children reintegration grant
program.

Extension of authority for treatment and rehabilitation for seriously
mentally ill and homeless veterans.

Extension of funding for financial assistance for supportive services
for very low-income veteran families in permanent housing.

Extension of funding for grant program for homeless veterans with
special needs.

Extension of authority to provide assistance for specially adapted
housing for disabled veterans residing temporarily in housing
owned by a family member.

Extension of authority for specially adapted housing assistive tech-
nology grant program.

Improvements to Partial Claim Program of the Department of Vet-
erans Affairs.

rovernment, Accountability Office reports on Partial Claim Program
of the Department of Veterans Affairs and other matters.

TITLE IV—OTHER MATTERS

Extension of subpoena authority of Inspector General of Department
of Veterans Affairs.

Extension of requirement for annual report on use of authority to
provide equitable relief.

Extension of authority for Secrctary of Veterans Affairs to transport
individuals to and from facilities of Department of Veterans
Affairs.

oS 2853 IS



O o0 9 N U BB WD =

|\ JEE O R O N O i O R T T S S N e
A W D= O O 0NN N R WD = O

Q
(3}

See. 404. Extension of authority relating to vendee loan program.
See. 405. Extension of authority for transfer of real property.

TITLE I—HEALTH CARE
MATTERS

SEC. 101. EXTENSION OF AUTHORITY FOR COLLECTION OF
COPAYMENTS FOR HOSPITAL CARE AND
NURSING HOME CARE.

Section 1710(f)(2)(B) of title 38, United States
Code, is amended by striking “September 30, 2025”7 and
inserting ‘“‘September 30, 2026,

SEC. 102. EXTENSION OF REQUIREMENT TO PROVIDE
NURSING HOME CARE TO CERTAIN VET-
ERANS WITH SERVICE-CONNECTED DISABIL-
ITIES.

Section 1710A(d) of title 38, United States Code, is
amended by striking “September 30, 2025”7 and inserting
“September 30, 2026,

SEC. 103. EXTENSION OF STAFF SERGEANT PARKER GOR-
DON FOX SUICIDE PREVENTION GRANT PRO-
GRAM.

Section 201(j) of the Commander John Scott
Hannon Veterans Mental Health Care Improvement Act
of 2019 (Public Law 116-171; 38 U.S.C. 1720F note)
is amended by striking “the date that is three years after
the date on which the first erant is awarded under this

section”” and inserting “September 30, 2026,

oS 2853 IS



O o0 9 N D kA WD =

[\ T O N i e e e T e e e e T
- O O o0 N o unm R~ WD = O

4
SEC. 104. EXTENSION OF FUNDING FOR EXPANSION OF

RURAL ACCESS NETWORK FOR GROWTH EN-
HANCEMENT PROGRAM.

Section 2(d) of the Sgt. Ketchum Rural Veterans
Mental Health Act of 2021 (Public Law 117-21; 38
U.S.C. 1712A note) is amended by striking “2025” and
inserting “2026”.

TITLE II—BENEFITS
SEC. 201. EXTENSION OF REQUIREMENT FOR QUARTERLY
BRIEFINGS ON ADMINISTRATION OF AU-
THORITIES RELATING TO DETERMINATIONS
REGARDING PRESUMPTIONS OF SERVICE
CONNECTION BASED ON TOXIC EXPOSURE.

Section 202(b)(2) of the Sergeant First Class Heath
Robinson Honoring our Promise to Address Comprehen-
sive Toxics Act of 2022 (Public Law 117-168) 1s amended
by striking “On a quarterly basis during the two-year pe-
riod beginning on the date of the enactment of this Act,”
and inserting “On a quarterly basis during the period be-
einning on the date of the enactment of this Act and end-

ing on December 31, 2026,

oS 2853 IS



-

J

1 SEC. 202. EXTENSION OF REQUIREMENT RELATING TO RES-

2
3
4
5
6
7
8
9

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21

TORATION OF ENTITLEMENT TO EDU-

CATIONAL ASSISTANCE IN CASES OF CLO-

SURE OR DISAPPROVAL OF EDUCATIONAL IN-

STITUTIONS.

Section 3699(¢)(2)(C) of title 38, United States

Code, is amended by striking “September 30, 2025 and

inserting ‘“‘September 30, 2026”.

SEC. 203. EXTENSION OF TEMPORARY CLARIFICATION OF

LICENSURE REQUIREMENTS FOR CON-
TRACTOR MEDICAL PROFESSIONALS TO PER-
FORM MEDICAL DISABILITY EXAMINATIONS
FOR THE DEPARTMENT OF VETERANS AF-
FAIRS UNDER PILOT PROGRAM FOR USE OF
CONTRACT PHYSICIANS FOR DISABILITY EX-

AMINATIONS.

Section 2002(a)(4) of the Johnny Isakson and David

P. Roe, M.D. Veterans Health Care and Benefits Improve-

ment Act of 2020 (Public Law 116-315; 38 U.S.C. 5101

note) is amended by striking “five years” and inserting

“six years”’.

oS 2853 IS



O o0 9 N D kA WD =

[\O JEE \© R O R O N e e e e e e D e e
W N = O O 0NN N N R WD = O

6
SEC. 204. EXTENSION OF AUTHORITY TO MAINTAIN RE-

GIONAL OFFICE IN REPUBLIC OF PHIL-
IPPINES.

Section 315(b) of title 38, United States Code, is
amended by striking “September 30, 2025”7 and inserting
“September 30, 20267,

TITLE III—HOUSING
SEC. 301. EXTENSION OF AUTHORIZATION OF APPROPRIA-
TIONS FOR HOMELESS WOMEN VETERANS
AND HOMELESS VETERANS WITH CHILDREN
REINTEGRATION GRANT PROGRAM.

Section 2021A(f)(1) of title 38, United States Code,
is amended by striking “2025” and inserting “2026"".

SEC. 302. EXTENSION OF AUTHORITY FOR TREATMENT AND
REHABILITATION FOR SERIOUSLY MENTALLY
ILL AND HOMELESS VETERANS.

(a) GENERAL TREATMENT.—Section 2031(b) of title
38, United States Code, is amended by striking “Sep-
tember 30, 2025”7 and inserting ‘“September 30, 2026”.

(b) ADDITIONAL SERVICES AT CERTAIN LOCA-

TIONS.

Section 2033(d) of title 38, United States Code,
is amended by striking “September 30, 2025 and insert-

ing “September 30, 2026,

oS 2853 IS



O o0 9 N D kA WD =

|\ TN NG N N R NG I NG I N R N e T e e T e T e e
LN A W D= O O NN N N Bl WNDY = O

7
SEC. 303. EXTENSION OF FUNDING FOR FINANCIAL ASSIST-
ANCE FOR SUPPORTIVE SERVICES FOR VERY
LOW-INCOME VETERAN FAMILIES IN PERMA-
NENT HOUSING.

Section 2044(e)(8) of title 38, United States Code,
is amended by striking “2025” and inserting “2026”.

SEC. 304. EXTENSION OF FUNDING FOR GRANT PROGRAM
FOR HOMELESS VETERANS WITH SPECIAL
NEEDS.

Section 2061(d)(1) of title 38, United States Code,
is amended by striking “2025” and inserting “2026".

SEC. 305. EXTENSION OF AUTHORITY TO PROVIDE ASSIST-
ANCE FOR SPECIALLY ADAPTED HOUSING
FOR DISABLED VETERANS RESIDING TEMPO-
RARILY IN HOUSING OWNED BY A FAMILY
MEMBER.

Section 2102A(e) of title 38, United States Code, is
amended by striking “September 30, 2025”7 and inserting
“September 30, 2026”.

SEC. 306. EXTENSION OF AUTHORITY FOR SPECIALLY
ADAPTED HOUSING ASSISTIVE TECHNOLOGY
GRANT PROGRAM.

Section 2108(g) of title 38, United States Code, is

amended by striking “September 30, 2025”7 and inserting

“September 30, 2026”.

oS 2853 IS



O o0 9 N D kA WD =

[\ I O R O N e e e T e e e e T e
N = OO 0 NN N N R WD = O

23
24
25
26

8
SEC. 307. IMPROVEMENTS TO PARTIAL CLAIM PROGRAM

OF THE DEPARTMENT OF VETERANS AF-
FAIRS.

(a) CLARIFICATION OF RELATIONSHIP TO OTHER
POWERS OF SECRETARY.—Section 3720(h) of title 38,
United States Code, is amended by striking ‘“‘of subsection
(a)” and all that follows through the period at the end
and inserting “of subsection (a) in conjunction with the
purchase of a loan under section 3732(a)(2) of this title
unless the Secretary determines the purchase would be
made consistent with section 3732(d) of this title.”.

(b) ADMINISTRATION OF PARTIAL CrLAIM PRO-
GRAM.—Section 3737 of such title is amended—

(1) in subsection (b)(2), by striking “first lien
cuaranteed loan for such property” and inserting
“amount of indebtedness under the guaranteed loan
that the Secretary does not purchase”; and

(2) 1 subsection (¢)—

(A) in paragraph (2)(B)(ii), by striking

“120 days” and inserting “180 days’’; and

(B) by amending paragraph (3) to read as
follows:

“(3) An amount paid to the holder of a loan as a
partial claim—

“(A) shall not alter the guaranty ecalculation
specified by section 3703 of this title;

oS 2853 IS



O o0 9 AN U B~ W

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

9
“(B) shall be included, for the purpose of a lig-
uidation sale, in the same manner as any other ad-
vance allowed by the Secretary; and
“(C) shall not be claimed under the guaranty or
increase the Secretary’s cost of acquisition of the
property securing the defaulted loan.”.

(¢) REQUIREMENTS OF LoOAN HOLDER.—Section
(d)(1) of such section is amending by inserting “‘and serv-
icing the loan” after “‘documents’.

(d) DErAULT AND FORECLOSURE.—Subsection (e)
of such section is amended—

(1) in paragraph (1)—

(A) in subparagraph (A), by striking “an
individual who” and all that follows through the
period at the end and inserting the following:
“a borrower who defaults on a partial claim
shall be liable to the Secretary for any loss suf-
fered by the Secretary with respect to such de-
fault, and such loss may be recovered in the
same manner as any other debt due the United
States. The Secretary shall not restore housing
loan entitlement under section 3702(b) of this
title until such loss is repaid in full.”’; and

(B) by amending subparagraph (B) to read

as follows:

oS 2853 IS



O o0 N N W BB W

O TN NG I N TR NG I NG I NS R N e e T e e T e T e e T
[ B N O N N = = N Re - BN B o) W ) TR ~S O I NO I e

10

“(B) The Secretary may charge administrative costs,
fees, and interest, as appropriate, with respect to any de-
fault under a partial claim in a manner similar to the in-
terest and administrative costs charged under section
5315 of this title.””; and

(2) by amending paragraph (2) to read as fol-
lows:

“(2) Notwithstanding section 2410 of title 28, a non-
judicial sale of real property to satisfy a loan guaranteed
under this chapter shall discharge the property from a
partial claim interest held by the Secretary, provided that
the holder of the guaranteed loan conducts the non-judi-
cial sale and distributes the sale proceeds, if any, in ac-
cordance with the State or local law where such property
is situated.”.

(¢) GUIDANCE IN ADVANCE OF REGULATIONS.—Sub-

section (h) of such section 1s amended to read as follows:

“(h) GUIDANCE IN ADVANCE OF REGULATIONS.

Notwithstanding any other provision of law, the Secretary
may, before prescribing regulations, issue administrative
ouidance with respect to the Partial Claim Program under
this section and the loss mitigation options prescribed
under section 3732(d) of this title, including any addi-
tional terms, conditions, and requirements the Secretary

determines necessary.”’.

oS 2853 IS



O o0 9 N U kA WD =

|\ TN NG T N T NG I NG I N B N e T e e T e e e
LN A W D= O O NN N N R WD = O

11

SEC. 308. GOVERNMENT ACCOUNTABILITY OFFICE RE-

PORTS ON PARTIAL CLAIM PROGRAM OF THE
DEPARTMENT OF VETERANS AFFAIRS AND
OTHER MATTERS.

(a) ANNUAL REPORTS.—

(1) IN GENERAL.—Not later than one year
after the date of the enactment of this Act, and
every year thereafter until the Partial Claim Pro-
eram terminates, the Comptroller General of the
United States shall submit to the Committee on Vet-
erans’ Affairs of the Senate and the Committee on
Veterans’ Affairs of the House of Representatives a
report.

(2) ELEMENTS.—Each report required by para-

oeraph (1) shall include, for the period covered by the
report and disaggregated by quarter, the following:
(A) Key data on the performance of the
Partial Claim Program, including—
(1) the number of partial claims filed
and approved; and
(1) the redefault and foreclosure rates
of loans for which a partial claim was
made.
(B) A comparison of the data described in

subparagraph (A) with data on the performance

oS 2853 IS



O o0 N N W BB W

[\ I \© R \O I O N N e e e e e e T e e
W N = O O 0N N RN = O

12
of other loss mitigation options provided by the
Department of Veterans Affairs.

(C) The number of housing loans insured,
ouaranteed, or made by the Secretary of Vet-
erans Affairs under chapter 37 of title 38,
United States Code.

(D) The number of applications for hous-
ing loan benefits under such chapter denied.

(E) The number of housing loans insured,
cuaranteed, or made by the Secretary under
such  chapter refinanced under  section
3710(a)(8) or 3712 of title 38, United States
Code.

(F) The number of veterans who owe a
payment on a mortgage associated with a loan
insured, guaranteed, or made by the Secretary
under such chapter that is at least—

(1) 60 days late; and
(1) 90 days late.

(b) ASSESSMENT.—

(1) IN GENERAL.—Not later than one year be-

fore the Partial Claim Program terminates, the

Jomptroller General shall—

oS 2853 IS



O o0 N N W B W =

[\© TN O T N T NG I NG N NG B e e T e e T e T e T Y =
[ B NG U N N = = N RN < BN B o) W ) TR ~S O I NO I e

13

(A) conduct an assessment of the benefits
and challenges of the Partial Claim Program;
and

(B) submit to the Committee on Veterans’
Affairs of the Senate and the Committee on
Veterans’ Affairs of the House of Representa-
tives a report on the findings of the Comptroller
General with respect to that assessment.

(2) CONSIDERATIONS.—In conducting the as-

sessment required by paragraph (1), the Comptroller

General shall consider the following:

(A) The characteristics of borrowers for
whom a partial claim was made compared to
the characteristics of borrowers provided other
loss mitigation options by the Department of
Veterans Affairs.

(B) The performance of loans guaranteed
under chapter 37 of title 38, United States
Code, following various loss mitigation actions.

(C) The information the Department con-
sidered in determining whether a borrower
would benefit from a partial claim compared to
other loss mitigation options.

(D) The costs to taxpayers of the Partial

Claim Program compared to the costs of other

oS 2853 IS



O o0 N N W BB W

[\© TN NG TN N T NG I NG I N0 B S e e T e e T e T e T T
[ T NG U N N e = NN - BN B o) W ) TR ~S O T NO S e

14
loss mitigation options provided by the Depart-
ment.

(E) Any similarities and differences in the
Department’s administration and use of the
Partial Claim Program compared to the De-
partment’s administration and use of the
COVID-19 Veterans Assistance Partial Claim
Payment program established under subpart F
of part 36 of title 38, Code of Regulations.

(F) The information the Department
learned from the COVID-19 Veterans Assist-
ance Partial Claim Payment program and the
extent to which those lessons learned were ap-
plied to the Partial Claim Program.

(G) The types of information the Depart-
ment collected to monitor the performance and
effectiveness of the Partial Claim Program and
how the Department used that information to
make any needed adjustments to the program.

(II) How the use by the Department of
partial claims compares to the use of partial
claims by other Federal housing agencies, in-
cluding, for each partial claim program—

(1) the volume of loans for which par-

tial claims have been made;

oS 2853 IS



O o0 N N BB W =

[\ I NS R T e e e T e T e D e e T
—_— O O o0 N N O nm R~ WD = O

15
(11) the results for borrowers (includ-
ing redefault and foreclosure rates); and
(iii) the costs to taxpayers.

(¢) PARTIAL CLAIM PROGRAM DEFINED.—In this
section, the term ‘“‘Partial Claim Program’ means the
Partial Claim Program of the Department of Veterans Af-
fairs carried out under section 3737 of title 38, United
States Code.

TITLE IV—OTHER MATTERS
SEC. 401. EXTENSION OF SUBPOENA AUTHORITY OF IN-

SPECTOR GENERAL OF DEPARTMENT OF
VETERANS AFFAIRS.

Section 312(d)(7)(A) of title 38, United States Code,
is amended by striking “September 30, 2025”7 and insert-
ing “September 30, 2026,

SEC. 402. EXTENSION OF REQUIREMENT FOR ANNUAL RE-
PORT ON USE OF AUTHORITY TO PROVIDE
EQUITABLE RELIEF.

Section 503(¢) of title 38, United States Code, is

amended by striking “December 31, 2025”7 and inserting

“December 31, 2026”.

oS 2853 IS



O o0 9 O D kA WD =

[\ N O R O N e e e e e e e T e T
N = O O 0 NN N N R W N = O

16
SEC. 403. EXTENSION OF AUTHORITY FOR SECRETARY OF

VETERANS AFFAIRS TO TRANSPORT INDIVID-
UALS TO AND FROM FACILITIES OF DEPART-
MENT OF VETERANS AFFAIRS.

Section 111A(a)(2) of title 38, United States Code,
is amended by striking “September 30, 2025 and insert-
ing “September 30, 2026,

SEC. 404. EXTENSION OF AUTHORITY RELATING TO VEND-
EE LOAN PROGRAM.

Section 3733(a)(8) of title 38, United States Code,
18 amended—

(1) in the matter preceding subparagraph (A),
by striking ““September 30, 2025” and inserting
“September 30, 2026”"; and

(2) in subparagraph (C), by striking “Sep-
tember 30, 2025”7 and inserting ‘“‘September 30,
20267,

SEC. 405. EXTENSION OF AUTHORITY FOR TRANSFER OF
REAL PROPERTY.

Section 8118(a)(d) of title 38, United States Code,
is amended by striking “September 30, 2025 and insert-
ing “September 30, 2026,

O

oS 2853 IS




<<
  /ASCII85EncodePages false
  /AllowTransparency false
  /AutoPositionEPSFiles true
  /AutoRotatePages /None
  /Binding /Left
  /CalGrayProfile (Dot Gain 20%)
  /CalRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CalCMYKProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /sRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CannotEmbedFontPolicy /Error
  /CompatibilityLevel 1.4
  /CompressObjects /Off
  /CompressPages true
  /ConvertImagesToIndexed true
  /PassThroughJPEGImages true
  /CreateJobTicket false
  /DefaultRenderingIntent /Default
  /DetectBlends true
  /DetectCurves 0.0000
  /ColorConversionStrategy /LeaveColorUnchanged
  /DoThumbnails false
  /EmbedAllFonts true
  /EmbedOpenType false
  /ParseICCProfilesInComments true
  /EmbedJobOptions true
  /DSCReportingLevel 0
  /EmitDSCWarnings false
  /EndPage -1
  /ImageMemory 1048576
  /LockDistillerParams true
  /MaxSubsetPct 100
  /Optimize false
  /OPM 1
  /ParseDSCComments true
  /ParseDSCCommentsForDocInfo true
  /PreserveCopyPage true
  /PreserveDICMYKValues true
  /PreserveEPSInfo true
  /PreserveFlatness true
  /PreserveHalftoneInfo false
  /PreserveOPIComments true
  /PreserveOverprintSettings true
  /StartPage 1
  /SubsetFonts false
  /TransferFunctionInfo /Preserve
  /UCRandBGInfo /Preserve
  /UsePrologue true
  /ColorSettingsFile ()
  /AlwaysEmbed [ true
  ]
  /NeverEmbed [ true
  ]
  /AntiAliasColorImages false
  /CropColorImages true
  /ColorImageMinResolution 300
  /ColorImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleColorImages false
  /ColorImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /ColorImageResolution 300
  /ColorImageDepth 8
  /ColorImageMinDownsampleDepth 1
  /ColorImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeColorImages true
  /ColorImageFilter /FlateEncode
  /AutoFilterColorImages false
  /ColorImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /ColorACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /ColorImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasGrayImages false
  /CropGrayImages true
  /GrayImageMinResolution 300
  /GrayImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleGrayImages false
  /GrayImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /GrayImageResolution 300
  /GrayImageDepth 8
  /GrayImageMinDownsampleDepth 2
  /GrayImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeGrayImages true
  /GrayImageFilter /FlateEncode
  /AutoFilterGrayImages false
  /GrayImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /GrayACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /GrayImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasMonoImages false
  /CropMonoImages true
  /MonoImageMinResolution 1200
  /MonoImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleMonoImages false
  /MonoImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /MonoImageResolution 1200
  /MonoImageDepth -1
  /MonoImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeMonoImages true
  /MonoImageFilter /CCITTFaxEncode
  /MonoImageDict <<
    /K -1
  >>
  /AllowPSXObjects false
  /CheckCompliance [
    /None
  ]
  /PDFX1aCheck true
  /PDFX3Check false
  /PDFXCompliantPDFOnly true
  /PDFXNoTrimBoxError false
  /PDFXTrimBoxToMediaBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXSetBleedBoxToMediaBox true
  /PDFXBleedBoxToTrimBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXOutputIntentProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /PDFXOutputConditionIdentifier (CGATS TR 001)
  /PDFXOutputCondition ()
  /PDFXRegistryName (http://www.color.org)
  /PDFXTrapped /False

  /CreateJDFFile false
  /Description <<

    /BGR <>
    /CHS <>
    /CHT <>
    /CZE <>
    /DAN <>
    /DEU <>
    /ESP <>
    /ETI <>
    /FRA <>
    /GRE <>

    /HRV <>
    /HUN <>
    /ITA (Utilizzare queste impostazioni per creare documenti Adobe PDF che devono essere conformi o verificati in base a PDF/X-1a:2001, uno standard ISO per lo scambio di contenuto grafico. Per ulteriori informazioni sulla creazione di documenti PDF compatibili con PDF/X-1a, consultare la Guida dell'utente di Acrobat. I documenti PDF creati possono essere aperti con Acrobat e Adobe Reader 4.0 e versioni successive.)
    /JPN <>
    /KOR <>
    /LTH <>
    /LVI <>
    /NLD (Gebruik deze instellingen om Adobe PDF-documenten te maken die moeten worden gecontroleerd of moeten voldoen aan PDF/X-1a:2001, een ISO-standaard voor het uitwisselen van grafische gegevens. Raadpleeg de gebruikershandleiding van Acrobat voor meer informatie over het maken van PDF-documenten die compatibel zijn met PDF/X-1a. De gemaakte PDF-documenten kunnen worden geopend met Acrobat en Adobe Reader 4.0 en hoger.)
    /NOR <>
    /POL <>
    /PTB <>
    /RUM <>
    /RUS <>
    /SKY <>
    /SLV <>
    /SUO <>
    /SVE <>
    /TUR <>
    /UKR <>
    /ENU (Use these settings to create Adobe PDF documents that are to be checked or must conform to PDF/X-1a:2001, an ISO standard for graphic content exchange.  For more information on creating PDF/X-1a compliant PDF documents, please refer to the Acrobat User Guide.  Created PDF documents can be opened with Acrobat and Adobe Reader 4.0 and later.)
  >>
  /Namespace [
    (Adobe)
    (Common)
    (1.0)
  ]
  /OtherNamespaces [
    <<
      /AsReaderSpreads false
      /CropImagesToFrames true
      /ErrorControl /WarnAndContinue
      /FlattenerIgnoreSpreadOverrides false
      /IncludeGuidesGrids false
      /IncludeNonPrinting false
      /IncludeSlug false
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (InDesign)
        (4.0)
      ]
      /OmitPlacedBitmaps false
      /OmitPlacedEPS false
      /OmitPlacedPDF false
      /SimulateOverprint /Legacy
    >>
    <<
      /AddBleedMarks false
      /AddColorBars false
      /AddCropMarks false
      /AddPageInfo false
      /AddRegMarks false
      /ConvertColors /ConvertToCMYK
      /DestinationProfileName ()
      /DestinationProfileSelector /DocumentCMYK
      /Downsample16BitImages true
      /FlattenerPreset <<
        /PresetSelector /HighResolution
      >>
      /FormElements false
      /GenerateStructure false
      /IncludeBookmarks false
      /IncludeHyperlinks false
      /IncludeInteractive false
      /IncludeLayers false
      /IncludeProfiles false
      /MultimediaHandling /UseObjectSettings
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (CreativeSuite)
        (2.0)
      ]
      /PDFXOutputIntentProfileSelector /DocumentCMYK
      /PreserveEditing true
      /UntaggedCMYKHandling /LeaveUntagged
      /UntaggedRGBHandling /UseDocumentProfile
      /UseDocumentBleed false
    >>
  ]
>> setdistillerparams
<<
  /HWResolution [2400 2400]
  /PageSize [612.000 792.000]
>> setpagedevice


		Superintendent of Documents
	2026-07-11T16:08:56-0400
	Government Publishing Office, Washington, DC 20401
	U.S. Government Publishing Office
	Government Publishing Office attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by Government Publishing Office




