AUTHENTICATED
U.S. GOVERNMENT
INFORMATION

GPO

1191H CONGRESS
L H,R. 954

To amend the Scholarships for Opportunity and Results Act with respect
to certain funding, testing, and evaluation requirements and to perma-
nently authorize an appropriation for such Act.

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES

FEBRUARY 4, 2025
Mr. MOOLENAAR introduced the following bill; which was referred to the
Committee on Oversight and Government Reform

A BILL

To amend the Scholarships for Opportunity and Results Act
with respect to certain funding, testing, and evaluation
requirements and to permanently authorize an appropria-
tion for such Act.

1 Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representa-
tives of the United States of America in Congress assembled,

SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE.

This Act may be cited as the “SOAR Permanent Au-

Y B S S B O]

thorization Act”.



1
2
3
4
5
6
7
8
9
10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25
26

2
SEC. 2. AMENDMENTS TO SCHOLARSHIPS FOR OPPOR-

TUNITY AND RESULTS ACT.
(a) CHANGE IN ACCREDITATION REQUIREMENTS.—
Section 3007(a)(5)(A)(1)(I) of the Scholarships for Oppor-
tunity and Results Act (sec. 38-1853.07(a)(5)(A)@1)(I),

D.C. Officaal Code) is amended to read as follows:

“(I) 1s fully aceredited by an ac-
crediting body with jurisdiction in the
District of Columbia or that is recog-
nized by the Student and Visitor Ex-
change English Language Program
administered by U.S. Immigration
and Customs Enforcement; or’.
(b) REMOVAL OF STUDENT ACADEMIC ASSISTANCE
Lovirr.—

(1) IN GENERAL.—Section 3007(b) of such Act
(sec. 38=1853.07 (b), D.C. Official Code) is amend-
ed

(A) in the header, by striking “AND Pa-
RENTAL ASSISTANCE” and inserting ““, PAREN-
TAL ASSISTANCE, AND STUDENT ACADEMIC
ASSISTANCE";

(B) in the matter preceding paragraph (1),
by striking “$2,000,000” and inserting
“$2,200,000”; and

(C) by adding at the end the following:

*HR 954 IH



O o0 N N W BB W

[\O T \© R (O R S i e e e e e e e T
DN = O 00N N R WD = O

23
24

25 1853.08(h), D.C. Official Code) is amended

MENTS.

3

“(3) The expenses of providing tutoring service
to participating eligible students that need additional
academic assistance. If there are msufficient funds
to provide tutoring services to all such students in
a year, the eligible entity shall give priority in such
yvear to students who previously attended an elemen-
tary school or secondary school identified as one of
the lowest-performing schools under the District of
Columbia’s accountability system.”.

(2) CONFORMING AMENDMENTS.—Section 3007
of such Act (see. 38=1853.07, D.C. Official Code) is
amended—

(A) by striking subsection (¢) and redesig-
nating subsection (d) as subsection (¢); and
(B) in subsection (¢), as so redesignated by
paragraph (A)—
(1) in paragraph (2)(B), by striking
“subsections (b) and (¢)” and inserting
“subsection (b)”’; and
(i1) in paragraph (3), by striking
“subsections (b) and (¢)” and inserting
“subsection (b)”.
(¢) CHANGE IN STANDARDIZED TESTING REQUIRE-
Section  3008(h)  of such  Act  (sec. 38—

*HR 954 IH



4

1 (1) in paragraph (1), by striking ‘“section
2 3009(a)(2)(A)(1)” and inserting “‘section 3009(a)’’;

3 (2) by amending paragraph (2) to read as fol-
4 lows:

5 “(2) ADMINISTRATION OF TESTS.—The Insti-
6 tute of Education Sciences may administer assess-
7 ments to students participating in the evaluation
8 under section 3009(a) for the purpose of conducting
9 the evaluation under such section.”; and

10 (3) in paragraph (3), by striking “the nation-
11 ally norm-referenced standardized test described in
12 paragraph (2)” and inserting ‘“‘a nationally norm-
13 referenced standardized test”.

14 (d) CHANGE IN EVALUATION KFREQUENCY AND

15 STANDARDS.—Section 3009(a) of such Act (sec. 38—

16 1853.09(a), D.C. Official Code) is amended—

17 (1) in paragraph (1)(A), by striking “annually”
18 and inserting “‘regularly’’;

19 (2) in paragraph (2)—

20 (A) by amending subparagraph (A)(i) to
21 read as follows:

22 “(1) 1s rigorous; and’’; and

23 (B) in subparagraph (B), by striking “im-
24 pact of the program” and all that follows
25 through the end of the subparagraph and in-

*HR 954 IH



O© o0 3 O WD A W N e

[\© TN NG I N T NG I NG I NS B N e T e e T e T e e
[ T NG U N N = = N R - BN B o) W ) TR ~S O I NO S e

5

serting “‘impact of the program on academic

progress and educational attainment.”;

(3) in paragraph (3)

(A) in the header, by striking “ON EDU-

CATION” and inserting “OF EDUCATION";

(B) in subparagraph (A)—

(i) by inserting ‘“‘the academic
progress of”” after “assess’; and

(ii) by striking “in each of grades 3"
and all that follows through the end of the
subparagraph and inserting *“; and’’;
(C) by striking subparagraph (B); and

(D) by redesignating subparagraph (C) as

subparagraph (B); and

(4) in paragraph (4)—

*HR 954 IH

(A) in subparagraph (A)—

(1) by striking “A comparison of the
academic achievement of participating eli-
oible students who wuse an opportunity
scholarship on the measurements described
in paragraph (3)(B) to the academic
achievement” and inserting “The academic
progress of participating eligible students
who use an opportunity scholarship com-

pared to the academic progress”; and



O o0 N N W BB W

[\© TN NG TN N T NG I NG I N0 B S e e T e e T e T e T T
[ T NG U N N e = NN - BN B o) W ) TR ~S O T NO S e

6

“, which may include

(i1) by inserting
students” after ‘“‘students with similar
backgrounds’’;

(B) in subparagraph (B), by striking “in-
creasing the satisfaction of such parents and
students with their choice” and inserting “‘those
parents’ and students’ satisfaction with the pro-
oram’’;

(C) by striking subparagraphs (D) through
(F) and inserting the following:

“(D) The high school graduation rates,
college enrollment rates, college persistence
rates, and college graduation rates of partici-
pating eligible students who use an opportunity
scholarship compared with the rates of public
school students described in subparagraph (A),
to the extent practicable.

“(E) The college enrollment rates, college
persistence rates, and college graduation rates
of students who participated in the program as
the result of winning the Opportunity Scholar-
ship Program lottery compared to the enroll-
ment, persistence, and graduation rates for stu-
dents who entered but did not win such lottery

and who, as a result, served as the control

*HR 954 IH



O o0 N N W BB W

e T SO =
W NN = O

14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23

7

oroup for previous evaluations of the program

under this division. Nothing in this subpara-

oraph may be construed to waive section

3004 (a)(3)(A)(11) with respect to any such stu-

dent.

“(F) The safety of the schools attended by
participating eligible students who use an op-
portunity scholarship compared with the schools
attended by public school students deseribed in
subparagraph (A), to the extent practicable.”;
and

(D) in subparagraph (G), by striking
“achievement” and inserting ‘‘progress’.

(e) PERMANENT AUTHORIZATION OF APPROPRIA-
TION.—Section 3014 of such Act (sec. 38-1853.14, D.C.
Official Code) 1s amended—

(1) in subsection (a), by striking “$60,000,000
for fiscal year 2012 and for each fiscal year through
fiscal year 2023”7 and inserting “$75,000,000 for
fiscal year 2024 and for each succeeding fiscal
year’’; and

(2) in subsection (b), by striking
“$60,000,000” and inserting “$75,000,000”.

O

*HR 954 IH




<<
  /ASCII85EncodePages false
  /AllowTransparency false
  /AutoPositionEPSFiles true
  /AutoRotatePages /None
  /Binding /Left
  /CalGrayProfile (Dot Gain 20%)
  /CalRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CalCMYKProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /sRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CannotEmbedFontPolicy /Error
  /CompatibilityLevel 1.4
  /CompressObjects /Off
  /CompressPages true
  /ConvertImagesToIndexed true
  /PassThroughJPEGImages true
  /CreateJobTicket false
  /DefaultRenderingIntent /Default
  /DetectBlends true
  /DetectCurves 0.0000
  /ColorConversionStrategy /LeaveColorUnchanged
  /DoThumbnails false
  /EmbedAllFonts true
  /EmbedOpenType false
  /ParseICCProfilesInComments true
  /EmbedJobOptions true
  /DSCReportingLevel 0
  /EmitDSCWarnings false
  /EndPage -1
  /ImageMemory 1048576
  /LockDistillerParams true
  /MaxSubsetPct 100
  /Optimize false
  /OPM 1
  /ParseDSCComments true
  /ParseDSCCommentsForDocInfo true
  /PreserveCopyPage true
  /PreserveDICMYKValues true
  /PreserveEPSInfo true
  /PreserveFlatness true
  /PreserveHalftoneInfo false
  /PreserveOPIComments true
  /PreserveOverprintSettings true
  /StartPage 1
  /SubsetFonts false
  /TransferFunctionInfo /Preserve
  /UCRandBGInfo /Preserve
  /UsePrologue true
  /ColorSettingsFile ()
  /AlwaysEmbed [ true
  ]
  /NeverEmbed [ true
  ]
  /AntiAliasColorImages false
  /CropColorImages true
  /ColorImageMinResolution 300
  /ColorImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleColorImages false
  /ColorImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /ColorImageResolution 300
  /ColorImageDepth 8
  /ColorImageMinDownsampleDepth 1
  /ColorImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeColorImages true
  /ColorImageFilter /FlateEncode
  /AutoFilterColorImages false
  /ColorImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /ColorACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /ColorImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasGrayImages false
  /CropGrayImages true
  /GrayImageMinResolution 300
  /GrayImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleGrayImages false
  /GrayImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /GrayImageResolution 300
  /GrayImageDepth 8
  /GrayImageMinDownsampleDepth 2
  /GrayImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeGrayImages true
  /GrayImageFilter /FlateEncode
  /AutoFilterGrayImages false
  /GrayImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /GrayACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /GrayImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasMonoImages false
  /CropMonoImages true
  /MonoImageMinResolution 1200
  /MonoImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleMonoImages false
  /MonoImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /MonoImageResolution 1200
  /MonoImageDepth -1
  /MonoImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeMonoImages true
  /MonoImageFilter /CCITTFaxEncode
  /MonoImageDict <<
    /K -1
  >>
  /AllowPSXObjects false
  /CheckCompliance [
    /None
  ]
  /PDFX1aCheck true
  /PDFX3Check false
  /PDFXCompliantPDFOnly true
  /PDFXNoTrimBoxError false
  /PDFXTrimBoxToMediaBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXSetBleedBoxToMediaBox true
  /PDFXBleedBoxToTrimBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXOutputIntentProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /PDFXOutputConditionIdentifier (CGATS TR 001)
  /PDFXOutputCondition ()
  /PDFXRegistryName (http://www.color.org)
  /PDFXTrapped /False

  /CreateJDFFile false
  /Description <<

    /BGR <>
    /CHS <>
    /CHT <>
    /CZE <>
    /DAN <>
    /DEU <>
    /ESP <>
    /ETI <>
    /FRA <>
    /GRE <>

    /HRV <>
    /HUN <>
    /ITA (Utilizzare queste impostazioni per creare documenti Adobe PDF che devono essere conformi o verificati in base a PDF/X-1a:2001, uno standard ISO per lo scambio di contenuto grafico. Per ulteriori informazioni sulla creazione di documenti PDF compatibili con PDF/X-1a, consultare la Guida dell'utente di Acrobat. I documenti PDF creati possono essere aperti con Acrobat e Adobe Reader 4.0 e versioni successive.)
    /JPN <>
    /KOR <>
    /LTH <>
    /LVI <>
    /NLD (Gebruik deze instellingen om Adobe PDF-documenten te maken die moeten worden gecontroleerd of moeten voldoen aan PDF/X-1a:2001, een ISO-standaard voor het uitwisselen van grafische gegevens. Raadpleeg de gebruikershandleiding van Acrobat voor meer informatie over het maken van PDF-documenten die compatibel zijn met PDF/X-1a. De gemaakte PDF-documenten kunnen worden geopend met Acrobat en Adobe Reader 4.0 en hoger.)
    /NOR <>
    /POL <>
    /PTB <>
    /RUM <>
    /RUS <>
    /SKY <>
    /SLV <>
    /SUO <>
    /SVE <>
    /TUR <>
    /UKR <>
    /ENU (Use these settings to create Adobe PDF documents that are to be checked or must conform to PDF/X-1a:2001, an ISO standard for graphic content exchange.  For more information on creating PDF/X-1a compliant PDF documents, please refer to the Acrobat User Guide.  Created PDF documents can be opened with Acrobat and Adobe Reader 4.0 and later.)
  >>
  /Namespace [
    (Adobe)
    (Common)
    (1.0)
  ]
  /OtherNamespaces [
    <<
      /AsReaderSpreads false
      /CropImagesToFrames true
      /ErrorControl /WarnAndContinue
      /FlattenerIgnoreSpreadOverrides false
      /IncludeGuidesGrids false
      /IncludeNonPrinting false
      /IncludeSlug false
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (InDesign)
        (4.0)
      ]
      /OmitPlacedBitmaps false
      /OmitPlacedEPS false
      /OmitPlacedPDF false
      /SimulateOverprint /Legacy
    >>
    <<
      /AddBleedMarks false
      /AddColorBars false
      /AddCropMarks false
      /AddPageInfo false
      /AddRegMarks false
      /ConvertColors /ConvertToCMYK
      /DestinationProfileName ()
      /DestinationProfileSelector /DocumentCMYK
      /Downsample16BitImages true
      /FlattenerPreset <<
        /PresetSelector /HighResolution
      >>
      /FormElements false
      /GenerateStructure false
      /IncludeBookmarks false
      /IncludeHyperlinks false
      /IncludeInteractive false
      /IncludeLayers false
      /IncludeProfiles false
      /MultimediaHandling /UseObjectSettings
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (CreativeSuite)
        (2.0)
      ]
      /PDFXOutputIntentProfileSelector /DocumentCMYK
      /PreserveEditing true
      /UntaggedCMYKHandling /LeaveUntagged
      /UntaggedRGBHandling /UseDocumentProfile
      /UseDocumentBleed false
    >>
  ]
>> setdistillerparams
<<
  /HWResolution [2400 2400]
  /PageSize [612.000 792.000]
>> setpagedevice


		Superintendent of Documents
	2026-07-11T08:41:50-0400
	Government Publishing Office, Washington, DC 20401
	U.S. Government Publishing Office
	Government Publishing Office attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by Government Publishing Office




