AUTHENTICATED
U.S. GOVERNMENT
INFORMATION

GPO

1191H CONGRESS
nL HL R, 3554

To provide greater controls and restrictions on revolving door lobbying.

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES

May 21, 2025
Mr. NEGUSE introduced the following bill; which was referred to the
Committee on the Judiciary

A BILL

To provide greater controls and restrictions on revolving door

lobbying.

[E—

Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representa-
tives of the United States of America in Congress assembled,
SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE.

This Act may be cited as the “Close the Revolving
Door Act of 20257,

SEC. 2. LIFETIME BAN ON MEMBERS OF CONGRESS FROM
LOBBYING.

(a) IN GENERAL.—Section 207(e)(1) of title 18,

O o0 9 AN U B~ W

United States Code, is amended to read as follows:

[a—
S

“(1) MEMBERS OF CONGRESS.

Any person

[E—
[—

who is a Senator, a Member of the House of Rep-



O o0 N N W BB W

[\O T \© R (O R R e e e e e e e T
N = O 00 NN R WD = O

2

resentatives, or an elected officer of the Senate or
the House of Representatives and who, after that
person leaves office, knowingly makes, with the in-
tent to influence, any communication to or appear-
ance before any Member, officer, or employee of ei-
ther House of Congress or any employee of any
other legislative office of the Congress, on behalf of
any other person (except the United States) in con-
nection with any matter on which such former Sen-
ator, Member, or elected official seeks action by a
Member, officer, or employee of either House of
Congress, in his or her official capacity, shall be
punished as provided in section 216 of this title.”.

(b) CONFORMING AMENDMENTS.—Section 207(e)(2)

of title 18, United States Code, is amended—

(1) in the heading, by striking “OFFICERS AND
STAFF” and inserting “STAFEF’;

(2) by striking “an elected officer of the Senate,
or;

(3) by striking ‘“‘leaves office or employment”
and inserting “leaves employment’’; and

(4) by striking “former elected officer or”.

*HR 3554 IH



O o0 9 N D kA WD =

e T S Y e T T e T s =N
O© o0 N O »n B~ W NN = O

20
21
22
23
24
25

Q
(3}

SEC. 3. CONGRESSIONAL STAFF.

Paragraphs (2), (3)(A), (4), (5)(A), and (6)(A) of

section 207(e) of title 18, United States Code, are each

amended by striking “1 year” and inserting ‘6 years”.

SEC.

4. IMPROVED REPORTING OF LOBBYISTS’ ACTIVITIES.

Section 6 of the Lobbying Disclosure Act of 1995 (2

U.S.C. 1605) is amended by adding at the end the fol-

lowing:

SEC.

“(¢) JoINT WEBSITE.—

“(1) IN GENERAL.—The Secretary of the Sen-
ate and the Clerk of the House of Representatives
shall maintain a joint lobbyist disclosure internet
database for information required to be publicly dis-
closed under this Act which shall be an easily
searchable website called lobbyists.gov with a stated
eoal of simplicity of usage.

“(2) AUTHORIZATION OF APPROPRIATIONS.

There is authorized to be appropriated to carry out
this subsection $100,000 for fiscal year 2026.”.
5. LOBBYIST REVOLVING DOOR TO CONGRESS.
(a) DEFINITIONS.—In this section—

(1) the term ‘“foreign principal” has the mean-
ing given that term under section 1(b) of the For-
eien Agents Registration Act of 1938, as amended

(22 U.S.C. 611(b));

*HR 3554 IH



O o0 N N D Bk W =

O TN NG I N T NG I NG R NS B S e e T e e T e T e e
[ B NG U N N = = N R - BN B e ) W ) B ~S O T NO R e

4
(2) the terms “lobbyist” and “‘lobbying contact”

have the meanings given such terms under section 3

of the Lobbying Disclosure Act of 1995 (2 U.S.C.

1602); and

(3) the term ‘“‘registered lobbyist” means a lob-
byist registered under the Lobbying Disclosure Act
of 1995 (2 U.S.C. 1601 et seq.).

(b) PROUIBITION.—Any person who is a registered
lobbyist or an agent of a foreign principal may not, within
6 years after that person leaves such position, be hired
by a Member or committee of either House of Congress
with whom the registered lobbyist or agent of a foreign
principal has had substantial lobbying contact.

(¢) WATVER.—This section may be waived in the Sen-
ate or the House of Representatives by the Select Com-
mittee on Ethies of the Senate or the Committee on
Standards of Official Conduct of the House of Representa-
tives, respectively, based on a compelling national need.

(d) SUBSTANTIAL LOBBYING CONTACT.—For pur-
poses of this section, in determining whether a registered
lobbyist or agent of a foreign principal has had substantial
lobbying contact within the applicable period of time, a
Member or committee of either House of Congress shall
take into consideration whether the individual’s lobbying

contacts have pertained to pending legislative business, or

*HR 3554 IH



O o0 N N W BB W

[\© TN NG T N TR NG I NG I NS R N e T e e T e T e e T
[ B N O N N = = N e R - BN B o) W ) B ~SU O T NO S e

-

J

related to solicitation of an earmark or other Federal
funding, particularly if such contacts included the coordi-
nation of meetings with the Member or committee, in-
volved presentations to employees of the Member or com-
mittee, or participation in fundraising (except for the mere
eiving of a personal contribution). Simple social contacts
with the Member or committee of either House of Con-
eress and staff, shall not by themselves constitute substan-
tial lobbying contacts.
SEC. 6. REPORTING BY SUBSTANTIAL LOBBYING ENTITIES.
The Lobbying Disclosure Act of 1995 (2 U.S.C. 1601
et seq.) 1s amended by inserting after section 6 the fol-
lowing:
“SEC. 6A. REPORTING BY SUBSTANTIAL LOBBYING ENTI-

TIES.

“(a) IN GENERAL.—A substantial lobbying entity
shall file on an annual basis with the Clerk of the House
of Representatives and the Secretary of the Senate a list
of each employee of, individual under contract with, or in-
dividual who provides paid consulting services to the sub-
stantial lobbying entity who 15—

“(1) a former Senator or a former Member of

the House of Representatives; or
“(2) another covered legislative branch official

who—

*HR 3554 IH



O o0 N N W BB W

|\ I O TR NG T NS R NS R L e e T e T e e e T
A W N = O VWV o0 NN O W BN~ WD = O

6
“(A) was paid not less than $100,000 in

any 1 year as a covered legislative branch offi-
clal;

“(B) worked for a total of not less than 4
years as a covered legislative branch official; or

“(C) had a job title at any time while em-
ployed as a covered legislative branch official
that contained any of the following terms:
‘Chief of Staff’, ‘Legislative Director’, ‘Staff
Director’, ‘Counsel’, ‘Professional Staff Mem-
ber’, ‘Communications Director’, or ‘Press Sec-
retary’.

“(b) CONTENTS OF FILING.—The filing required
under this section shall contain a brief job description of
each individual described in subsection (a) and an expla-
nation of their work experience under subsection (a) that
requires this filing.

“(¢) IMPROVED REPORTING OF SUBSTANTIAL LOB-

BYING ENTITIES.

The joint website being maintained by
the Secretary of the Senate and the Clerk of the House
of Representatives, known as lobbyists.gov, shall include
an easily searchable, sortable, and downloadable database
with an Application Programming Interface (API) or simi-

lar feature entitled ‘Substantial Lobbying Entities’ that

*HR 3554 IH



O o0 N N B W =

[\ I e e e e e T e e
S OV o0 N O B PR~ WD = O

7

includes information on all individuals described in sub-
section (a).

“(d) LAaw ENFORCEMENT OVERSIGHT.—The Clerk
of the House of Representatives and the Secretary of the
Senate shall provide a copy of each filing under subsection
(a) to the United States Attorney for the District of Co-
lumbia, to allow the United States Attorney for the Dis-
trict of Columbia to determine whether a substantial lob-
bying entity is underreporting the lobbying activities of its
employees, individuals under contract, or individuals who
provide paid consulting services.

“(e) SUBSTANTIAL LOBBYING ENTITY.—In this sec-
tion, the term ‘substantial lobbying entity’ means an incor-
porated entity that employs more than 3 registered lobby-
ists during a filing period.”.

SEC. 7. ENHANCED PENALTIES.

Section 7(a) of the Liobbying Disclosure Act of 1995
(2 U.S.C. 1606(a)) is amended, in the matter following
paragraph (2), by striking “$200,000” and inserting
“$500,000”.

*HR 3554 IH




<<
  /ASCII85EncodePages false
  /AllowTransparency false
  /AutoPositionEPSFiles true
  /AutoRotatePages /None
  /Binding /Left
  /CalGrayProfile (Dot Gain 20%)
  /CalRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CalCMYKProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /sRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CannotEmbedFontPolicy /Error
  /CompatibilityLevel 1.4
  /CompressObjects /Off
  /CompressPages true
  /ConvertImagesToIndexed true
  /PassThroughJPEGImages true
  /CreateJobTicket false
  /DefaultRenderingIntent /Default
  /DetectBlends true
  /DetectCurves 0.0000
  /ColorConversionStrategy /LeaveColorUnchanged
  /DoThumbnails false
  /EmbedAllFonts true
  /EmbedOpenType false
  /ParseICCProfilesInComments true
  /EmbedJobOptions true
  /DSCReportingLevel 0
  /EmitDSCWarnings false
  /EndPage -1
  /ImageMemory 1048576
  /LockDistillerParams true
  /MaxSubsetPct 100
  /Optimize false
  /OPM 1
  /ParseDSCComments true
  /ParseDSCCommentsForDocInfo true
  /PreserveCopyPage true
  /PreserveDICMYKValues true
  /PreserveEPSInfo true
  /PreserveFlatness true
  /PreserveHalftoneInfo false
  /PreserveOPIComments true
  /PreserveOverprintSettings true
  /StartPage 1
  /SubsetFonts false
  /TransferFunctionInfo /Preserve
  /UCRandBGInfo /Preserve
  /UsePrologue true
  /ColorSettingsFile ()
  /AlwaysEmbed [ true
  ]
  /NeverEmbed [ true
  ]
  /AntiAliasColorImages false
  /CropColorImages true
  /ColorImageMinResolution 300
  /ColorImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleColorImages false
  /ColorImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /ColorImageResolution 300
  /ColorImageDepth 8
  /ColorImageMinDownsampleDepth 1
  /ColorImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeColorImages true
  /ColorImageFilter /FlateEncode
  /AutoFilterColorImages false
  /ColorImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /ColorACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /ColorImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasGrayImages false
  /CropGrayImages true
  /GrayImageMinResolution 300
  /GrayImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleGrayImages false
  /GrayImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /GrayImageResolution 300
  /GrayImageDepth 8
  /GrayImageMinDownsampleDepth 2
  /GrayImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeGrayImages true
  /GrayImageFilter /FlateEncode
  /AutoFilterGrayImages false
  /GrayImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /GrayACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /GrayImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasMonoImages false
  /CropMonoImages true
  /MonoImageMinResolution 1200
  /MonoImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleMonoImages false
  /MonoImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /MonoImageResolution 1200
  /MonoImageDepth -1
  /MonoImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeMonoImages true
  /MonoImageFilter /CCITTFaxEncode
  /MonoImageDict <<
    /K -1
  >>
  /AllowPSXObjects false
  /CheckCompliance [
    /None
  ]
  /PDFX1aCheck true
  /PDFX3Check false
  /PDFXCompliantPDFOnly true
  /PDFXNoTrimBoxError false
  /PDFXTrimBoxToMediaBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXSetBleedBoxToMediaBox true
  /PDFXBleedBoxToTrimBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXOutputIntentProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /PDFXOutputConditionIdentifier (CGATS TR 001)
  /PDFXOutputCondition ()
  /PDFXRegistryName (http://www.color.org)
  /PDFXTrapped /False

  /CreateJDFFile false
  /Description <<

    /BGR <>
    /CHS <>
    /CHT <>
    /CZE <>
    /DAN <>
    /DEU <>
    /ESP <>
    /ETI <>
    /FRA <>
    /GRE <>

    /HRV <>
    /HUN <>
    /ITA (Utilizzare queste impostazioni per creare documenti Adobe PDF che devono essere conformi o verificati in base a PDF/X-1a:2001, uno standard ISO per lo scambio di contenuto grafico. Per ulteriori informazioni sulla creazione di documenti PDF compatibili con PDF/X-1a, consultare la Guida dell'utente di Acrobat. I documenti PDF creati possono essere aperti con Acrobat e Adobe Reader 4.0 e versioni successive.)
    /JPN <>
    /KOR <>
    /LTH <>
    /LVI <>
    /NLD (Gebruik deze instellingen om Adobe PDF-documenten te maken die moeten worden gecontroleerd of moeten voldoen aan PDF/X-1a:2001, een ISO-standaard voor het uitwisselen van grafische gegevens. Raadpleeg de gebruikershandleiding van Acrobat voor meer informatie over het maken van PDF-documenten die compatibel zijn met PDF/X-1a. De gemaakte PDF-documenten kunnen worden geopend met Acrobat en Adobe Reader 4.0 en hoger.)
    /NOR <>
    /POL <>
    /PTB <>
    /RUM <>
    /RUS <>
    /SKY <>
    /SLV <>
    /SUO <>
    /SVE <>
    /TUR <>
    /UKR <>
    /ENU (Use these settings to create Adobe PDF documents that are to be checked or must conform to PDF/X-1a:2001, an ISO standard for graphic content exchange.  For more information on creating PDF/X-1a compliant PDF documents, please refer to the Acrobat User Guide.  Created PDF documents can be opened with Acrobat and Adobe Reader 4.0 and later.)
  >>
  /Namespace [
    (Adobe)
    (Common)
    (1.0)
  ]
  /OtherNamespaces [
    <<
      /AsReaderSpreads false
      /CropImagesToFrames true
      /ErrorControl /WarnAndContinue
      /FlattenerIgnoreSpreadOverrides false
      /IncludeGuidesGrids false
      /IncludeNonPrinting false
      /IncludeSlug false
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (InDesign)
        (4.0)
      ]
      /OmitPlacedBitmaps false
      /OmitPlacedEPS false
      /OmitPlacedPDF false
      /SimulateOverprint /Legacy
    >>
    <<
      /AddBleedMarks false
      /AddColorBars false
      /AddCropMarks false
      /AddPageInfo false
      /AddRegMarks false
      /ConvertColors /ConvertToCMYK
      /DestinationProfileName ()
      /DestinationProfileSelector /DocumentCMYK
      /Downsample16BitImages true
      /FlattenerPreset <<
        /PresetSelector /HighResolution
      >>
      /FormElements false
      /GenerateStructure false
      /IncludeBookmarks false
      /IncludeHyperlinks false
      /IncludeInteractive false
      /IncludeLayers false
      /IncludeProfiles false
      /MultimediaHandling /UseObjectSettings
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (CreativeSuite)
        (2.0)
      ]
      /PDFXOutputIntentProfileSelector /DocumentCMYK
      /PreserveEditing true
      /UntaggedCMYKHandling /LeaveUntagged
      /UntaggedRGBHandling /UseDocumentProfile
      /UseDocumentBleed false
    >>
  ]
>> setdistillerparams
<<
  /HWResolution [2400 2400]
  /PageSize [612.000 792.000]
>> setpagedevice


		Superintendent of Documents
	2026-07-10T18:28:06-0400
	Government Publishing Office, Washington, DC 20401
	U.S. Government Publishing Office
	Government Publishing Office attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by Government Publishing Office




